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orbINANCE  2022-10-20-0773

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL
COST OF $376,000.00, INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE
DEPARTMENT’S FY 2023 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) HAMPEL OIL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC., AND MIDTEX OIL, L.P.,, FOR BULK DIESEL
FLUID; (B) TELLUS EQUIPMENT SOLUTIONS, LLC, FOR JOHN
DEERE REPLACEMENT PARTS AND SERVICE; AND (C) C.D.S.
PROPERTIES, INC., DBA SOUTHWEST PUBLIC SAFETY, FOR
INSTALLATION, REMOVAL, AND REPAIR SERVICES OF SAFETY
EQUIPMENT FOR POLICE MOTORCYCLES.

* % % * %

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Laredo Gonzalez Auto Parts failed to meet the City’s
specifications and/or requirements for John Deere replacement parts and service; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves contracts with (A) Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc., and Midtex
Oil, L.P., for bulk diesel fluid; (B) Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC, for John Deere replacement
parts and service; and (C) C.D.S. Properties, Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for installation,
removal, and repair services of safety equipment for police motorcycles; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids and offers to furnish the City with goods and services on an
annual basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and
endorsements: (A) Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc., and Midtex Oil, L.P., for bulk diesel fluid; (B)
Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC, for John Deere replacement parts and service; and (C) C.D.S.
Properties, Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for installation, removal, and repair services of
safety equipment for police motorcycles. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in
the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid submitted by Laredo Gonzalez Auto
Parts failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements for John Deere replacement parts
and service.

SECTION 3. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal
Year 2023 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their
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terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 20™ day of October, 2022.

A Y O
Ron Nirenb

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Aﬁf)ebbie Racca-Sittre, City Clerk /\,Endrew"ISegovia, City Attorney

[\]



11.

City of San Antonio

City Council Meeting
October 20, 2022

2022-10-20-0773
Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an
estimated annual cost of $376,000 included in the respective department's FY 2023 Adopted
Budget: (A) Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc., and Midtex Oil, L.P., for bulk diesel fluid; (B) Tellus
Equipment Solutions, LLC, for John Deere replacement parts and service; and (C) C.D.S.
Properties, Inc., dba Southwest Public Safety, for installation, removals, and repair services of
safety equipment for police motorcycles. [Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott,
Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember Viagran moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Rocha
Garcia seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo,
Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Perry
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: July 13, 2022 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Bulk Diesel Exhaust Fluid Hampel Oil Midtex Oil LP NAPA Auto Parts HJDJ American Lube
(DEF) Distributors, Inc. Supply
6100015295 LD 911 Carter Ave 3455 |.H. 35 South 6374 Rittiman Road {8165 Whisper Oak
Estimated |Hondo, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |TX 78861 TX 78132 TX 78218 TX 78266
Quantity 817-243-8463 713-412-6020
1 Bulk Delivery, including DEF Transportation &
Delivery
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF): 85,000
Price (Price Per Gallon): $1.99 $2.04 $2.66 $2.59
Price Total: $169,150.00 $173,400.00 $226,100.00 $220,150.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $221,578.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 30.99%
local bid:
Price Differential: $52,428.00
Primary Brand Name, Trade Name: Hampel Oil Exhaust] Musket Purest Products| Quality DEF Solutions
Fluid
Secondary Brand Name, Trade Name: Not Provided Bluesky Not Provided Not Provided
2 Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 55 gallon container 3,300
Price adjusted per gallon for evaluation $3.64 $3.40 $4.47 $3.64
purposes
Price (Per Gallon 55 Gallon Drum): $200.20 $187.20 $246.06/55=%4.47
Price Total: $12,012.00 $11,232.00, $14,751.00 $12,012.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 2%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $14,455.98
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 31%
local bid:
Price Differential: $3,223.98
Primary Brand Name, Trade Name: Hampel Oil Exhaust| Musket|| NAPA Diesel Exhaust| Quality DEF Solutions
Fluid Fluid
Secondary Brand Name, Trade Name: Not Provided Bluesky|| Diesel Exhaust Fluid Not Provided
(Blue DEF)
3 Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 2.5 gallon container | 12,000
Price adjusted per gallon for evaluation $10.62 $4.192 $4.73 $4.214
purposes
Price (Per Gallon 2.5 Gallon Container): $4.192/Per] 11.83/2.5=$4.73
Gallon/$10.48/Per 2.5
gallon container]
Price Total: $127,440.00 $50,304.00 $56,784.00 $50,568.00
(12,000/2.5,
gal=4,800
Prompt Payment Discount: 2%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $55,648.32
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and 10.62%
local bid:
Price Differential: e $5,344.32
Primary Brand Name, Trade Name: Hampel Oil Exhaust| Musket|l NAPA Diesel Exhaust| Quality DEF Solutions
Fluid Fluid
Secondary Brand Name, Trade Name: Not Provided Bluesky|| Diesel Exhaust Fluid Not Provided
(Blue DEF)
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30)] 2% 10 days, Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total: $308,602.00 $234,936.00 $291,682.30 $282,730.00
Estimated Annual Award: $169,150.00 $61,536.00
Prepared by Purchasing 9/24/2022 Page 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 12, 2022 Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for John Deere Parts and Service Tellus Equipment Solutions Laredo Gonzalez Auto Parts
2002 West Grand Parkway 4220 San Bernardo Ave
6100015679 SN North, Suite 305
v Katy Laredo
Item Description An::;néa:z:my TX, 77449 TX, 78041
(832) 605-4401
NAS
1A John Deere Agricultural Tractor Parts and Service
(a) Percent of discount offered: 0% N/A
(b) Products Identification: John Deere| N/A
(c) Type of Price Schedule: Deere List Net Price Quote
(d) Price Schedule Number: Not Specified Not Specified
(e) Date of Price Schedule: 8/1/2022 Not Specified
) Price Schedule Column on which discount is based: List] Net Price Quote
(9) Warranty: 6 months unless Tellus 90 Days
installed, then 12 month
1B Specified Items for evaluation purposes only
1C John Deere Agriculture Tractor Labor and Service
a Regular Labor and Service Rates 100
Unit Price Per Hour: $120.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $12,000.00 No Bid
b Expedited Labor and Service Rates 10
Unit Price Per Hour: $130.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $1,300.00 No Bid
*ALL PRICES SUBMITTED
ARE FIXED UNLESS THERE
ARE DRASTIC
FLUCTUATIONS IN THE
MARKET, RESULTING IN
PRICE INCREASE.
*ANY PRICE INCREASE WILL
BE COMMUNICATED TO
THE PURCHASING
DEPARTMENT.
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $40,000.00 Incomplete

Estimated Annual Award

$40,000.00




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 7, 2022
For: Annual Contract For Installs, Removals and Repairs of Equipment for Police Motorcycles Local
C.D.S. Properties ,Inc. d.b.a
Southwest Public Safety
6100015854 AAS 9905 Perrin Beitel
Y San Antonio
Item Description Anfj:l"éa:::ﬁt TX 78217
v 210-590-9363
1 HONDA GOLDWINGS 6

INSTALL - Installation of Equipment of Equipment
Flat Rate for Complete Installation

Price Each $3,400.00

Price Total $20,400.00

Warranty 36 Months
2 HONDA GOLDWINGS 8

REMOVAL - Removal & Reinstallation of Equipment
Flat Rate for complete job

Price Each $4,020.00

Price Total $32,160.00

Warranty 36 Months
3 HONDA GOLDWINGS 12

RESTORE — Restoration to Original Manufacturer's

Equipment

Flat rate for: Removed from one Motorcycle to another and
restore back to original condition prior to install

Price Each $620.00

Price Total $7,440.00

Warranty 36 Months
4 HONDA GOLDWINGS 170

OTHER — Labor Rate for All Other Repairs and Services
Labor and repair service rate for all other services not listed

Price Each $120.00

Price Total $20,400.00

Warranty 36 Months
5 BMW 5

INSTALL - Installation of Equipment of Equipment Listed
Flat Rate for Complete Installation

Price Each $1,200.00

Price Total $6,000.00

Warranty 36 Months
6 BMW 5

REMOVAL — Removal & Reinstallation of Equipment
Flat Rate for complete job

Price Each $1,680.00

Price Total $8,400.00

Warranty 36 Months
7 BMW 5

RESTORE — Restoration to Original Manufacturer's

Equipment

Flat rate for: Removed from one Motorcycle to another and
restore back to original condition prior to install

Price Each $480.00
Price Total $2,400.00
Warranty 36 Months




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Local

Opened: September 7, 2022
For: Annual Contract For Installs, Removals and Repairs of Equipment for Police Motorcycles
6100015854 AAS

ltem Description Estimated

Annual Quantity

C.D.S. Properties ,Inc. d.b.a
Southwest Public Safety
9905 Perrin Beitel

San Antonio

TX 78217

210-590-9363

BMW
OTHER - Labor Rate for All Other Repairs and Services
Labor and repair service rate for all other services not listed

Price Each
Price Total
Warranty
Payment Terms

Business Hours and Servicing location(s)
Days and Hours of Operation:

Weekends

Estimated Annual Total

71

$120.00
$8,520.00
36 Months

1%, Net 10
Monday-Friday

Time: 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM
NA|

$105,720.00

Estimated Annual Award

$105,720.00|




